

F54 Bid Tab		Page 1 of 1	Pursuant to the Invitation to Bid extended for West TN 4H Security Upgrades 540/001-02-2020							Signature required only by Presiding Official. Others can be printed or typed.		
Bids opened in Lone Oaks		How many addenda issued: 1	bids and modifications must have been received here by 1:00 pm CST							Presiding Official <i>Hans Dietrich</i>		
Target 320,000		Contract Time 120 days	I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open and read bids and modifications which have been received.							Designer represented by Michel Lebel		
MACC 352,000		Liquidated Damages \$1,000 per day	Owner represented by									
Regulated Subcontractors		Bidders (name, city, license number)	Crime Stm	Adden Ack	Bid Secur	Unit Prices	Drug Affid	Base Bid	Alt #1	Alt #2	Alt #3	Other notations
Electrical		Name Bluff City Construction										No Bid
Geotherm		City Memphis, TN 38104										
HVAC		License Number										
Masonry												
Plumbing												
Roofing												
Electrical	Davis Electric	Name Barnes & Brower, Inc.	x	x	x	N/A	x	465,873.00	10,675.00	32,009.00		No Bid
Geotherm	N/A	City Memphis, TN 38118										
HVAC	N/A	License Number 52754						Base+Alt.1= 476,548.00	Base+A1,2= 508,557.00			
Masonry	Jones Construction											
Plumbing	Did not fill out											
Roofing	Did not fill out											
Electrical	Delta Electrical, Inc.	Name Grinder, Taber & Grinder, Inc.	x	x	x	N/A	x	332,000.00	5,500.00	10,900.00		No Bid
Geotherm	N/A	City Memphis, TN 38119										
HVAC	N/A	License Number 00010555						Base+Alt.1= 337,500.00	Base+A1,2= 348,400.00			
Masonry	Structural Waterproofing											
Plumbing	N/A											
Roofing	N/A											
Electrical		Name P&C Construction, Inc										No Bid
Geotherm		City Chattanooga TN 37402										
HVAC		License Number										
Masonry												
Plumbing												
Roofing												
Electrical	Roberts Builder, Inc.	Name Roberts Builder, Inc.	x	x	x	N/A	x	218,000.00	12,000.00	43,000.00		Non Compliant Bid
Geotherm	N/A	City Ripley MS 38663										
HVAC	N/A	License Number 45454						Base+Alt.1= 230,000.00	Base+A1,2= 273,000.00			
Masonry	Roberts Builder, Inc.											
Plumbing	N/A											
Roofing	N/A											