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F54 Bid Tab
Page 

Bids opened in How many 

11 
of 

UT Middlebrook Building addenda issued: 

Target Contract Time 

12 

2 

10,000,000 360 doyo 

MACC Liquidated Damages 
11,027,000 $1,000 per doy 

Pursuant to the Invitation to Bid extended for 
Library Storage Building 

University of Tennessee Knoxville 

SBC Project No. 540/009-14-2022 

bids and modifications must have been received here by 
2:00pm, local time on October 3, 2024 

I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed lo open 
and read bids and modifications which have been received. 

Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, ficense number) Crime Acklen Bid Unll Dn1g Base Bid Alt#1 Alt#2 
Electrical ShoffnerKalthoff, MES, Inc Name 
Geotherm NIA Blaine Construction 

Corporation HVAC J & F Mechanical, Inc. 

Masonry NIA City Knoxville, TN 
'"""" '""'""""""'""'""'" f'""'""""-------

-

1 
Plumbing The Cherokee Group, LLC License Number j 
Roofing Allen•s

"
R�fi�-��i��:·-··"""·"'·-

l
Electrical Grace Electric, LLC Name 

28904 

1-------------· 
Geo1herm NIA Burwil Construction 
............................ 

HVAC 

Masonry 

Plumbing 

Roofing 

Electrical 
··---··"''"'"""'"' 

J & F Mechanical, Inc. 

NIA City Knoxville, TN 

Cherokee Group, LLC 

Allen's Roofing, Inc. 
________ License Number 

I 
________ _,Namo 

8047 

Geotherm Horner Building Company 

HVAC 

Masonry 
� ........... , .......... 

City P�eon Forge, TN 

Plumbing 
............ , 

Roofing 
license Number j ---------

! 
No Bid 

Electrical _Edison ___Electric ___ 

Geotherm None Required
_ Name 

Integrated Builds, LLC 
HVAC J & F Mechanical, Inc. 

Mason,y NIA Chattanooga, TN 

Plumbing J & F Mechonical. Inc. License Number I 1------------
i Roofing Rackley Roofing ! 

Electrical Funderburk Electric Name 

60948 

Geotherm N/A King Construction Group 
HVAC Stone Service Corp. 

Masonry NI A City Cookeville, TN 

��.�-�.�i�� Stone Service Co��-
-

.. H•-.. ••H License Number i , _  

Roofing Allen's Roofing, Inc. 

Electrical Funderburk Electric Name 

56341 

Geotherm NIA Merit Construction, Inc. 
HVAC J & F Mechanical, Inc. 
Masonry N/A City Knoxville, TN 

,----------I Plumbing The Cherokee Group, LLC License Number I 
Roofing Allen's Roofing, Inc. I 

20853 

TN Higher Education - Standard Document - July 2019 

Stm Ack Secur Prices Ntid 

F 1: Yes Yes Yes Yes 

2: Yes ,-

F 1: Yes Yes Yes Yes 

2: Yes 

F 1: Yes Yes Yes Yes 

2: Yes 

1: Yes Yes 

2: Yes 

1: Yes Yes 

2: Yes 

Yes Yes 

Yes Yes 

9,269,000.00 

9,440,000.00 

---

-

10,200,000.00 

9,146,000.00 

9,425,000.00 

8,671.00 149,000.00 

Base+Alt.1= Base+Al,2= 
9,277,671.00 9,426,671.00 

8,000.00 165,000.00 

Base+Alt.1= Base+Al,2= 
9,448,000.00 9,613,000.00 

- -

-

4,800.00 140,600.00 

Base+Alt.l= Base+Al,2= 
10,204,800.00 10,345,400.00 

8,500.00 295,000.00 

Base+Alt.1= Base+Al,2= 
9,154,500.00 9,449,500.00 

10,200.00 285,000.00 

Base+Alt.1= Base+Al,2= 
9,435,200.00 9,720,200.00 

Signature required only by Presiding Official. 
Others can be printod or typed. 

Presiding 
Official � ;!7/ .,!�· .. 

-.: --
-

--: ,/4'� ··--·---. -----· ��s:•:ted y Susann arovella 

Owner 
represented by 

Unit Prices 
1. Structural Steel $5,300/Ton 
2. Concrete $600/CY 
3. Concrete Reinforcing $2, 000/T on 
�,

unoercut, Kecompact $43/CY 

1. Structural Steel 

2. Concrete 

3. Concrete Reinforcing 
4. Undercut, Recompact 
RI 

1. Structural Steel 

2. Concrete 

3. Concrete Reinforcing 
4. Undercut, R:ecompact 
Fl! 

1. Structural Steel 

2. Concrete 

3. Concrete Reinforcing 
4. Undercut, H.ecompact 
Fill 

1. Structural Steel 

2. Concrete 

3. Concrete Reinforcing 
4. Undercut, R:ecornpact 
Fill 

1. Slructural Steel 

2. Concrete 

3. Concrete Reinforcing 

4. Undercut, t<ecompact 
Fl! 

$6,702/Ton 
$536/CY 
$2,359/Ton 
$48/CY 

$ __ /Ton 
$ __ /CY 
$ __ /Ton 
$ __ /CY 

$5,300/Ton 
$375/CY 
$1,420/Ton 
$60/CY 

$6,250/Ton 
$1,000/CY 
$2,400/Ton 
$45/CY 

$5,300/Ton 
$600/CY 
$2,000/Ton 
$43/CY 

Steven P. Starnes 

Other notations 

N/A 

N/A 

N/A 

NIA 

NIA 
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No Bid



No Bid

No Bid




