				Note	e: None of the	cells are pr	rotected; B	id Tab	works b	est if yo	ou use t	ne un-sh	aded spaces, then clear awa			ne Designers' Manual Cha	pter 5 on Procurement	
	F54 Bid Tab Page 1 of 2					2	Pursuant to the Invitation to Bid extended for									Signature required only by Presiding Official.		
F54 BIG I ab												lyde York 4-H Cen	•			Others can be printed or t	typed.	
Bids opened	d in		How many 2			2	University of Tennessee, Knoxville / Knox									Presiding	David Kaminsky	
	(Crossville	ad	lden	da issued:		UT No. 999/001-102-2023								Official	David Kumuneny		
Target	Contract Time						bids and modifications must have been received here by										Designer	Brian E. McDonald \$\mathcal{B}\mathcal{E}M\$
		550,000			120	days	11:00 am, local time, June 7, 2024										represented by	Bhan E. Weberlaid 33C.76
MACC			Liquidat	ed Dan	nages	ľ		I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open										David Kaminalar
					\$1,000	per day	and read bids and modifications which have been received.										represented by	David Kaminsky
Regula	Bidders (name, city, license no				umber)	Crime Stm	Adden Ack	Bid Secur	Unit Prices	Drug Affid	Base Bid	Alt #1	Alt #2	Alt #3	Alt #4	Other notations		
Electrical	N/A		Name															
Geotherm	N/A		Eskola, LLC				V		2/	√	√	√	472,930.00	65,990.00	59,950.00			\$17.80/lf
HVAC	N/A							1							39,930.00			
Masonry	N/A		City	Knox	/ille, TN										\$4.05/sf			
Plumbing	N/A		License	Numbe	er	53339								Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			
Roofing	Eskola, LLC												538,920.00	598,870.00				
Electrical			Name		•		T I							222,220.00	222,210100			
Geotherm			· •anne	Foa	m-Crete	. Inc.							NO DIE					
HVAC					5.666,	,							NO BID					
Masonry			City	Chatta	anooga													
Plumbing			-		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·													
			License	Numbe	er	15120												
Roofing	Brickhouse E	1																
			Name	Fue	I Tank M	aintena	nance								1			
Geotherm	None Requi	red		Con	npany, L	LC			Only 1	\checkmark	$\sqrt{}$	$\sqrt{}$	468,000.00	18,900.00	47,880.00			A. 00 //r
HVAC	None Requ	ired	0:4	01-	eville, TN												\$4.00/lf	
Masonry	None Requi	red	City	COOK	eville, TN													\$5.00/sf
Plumbing	None Requ		License	Numbe	er	37040								Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			
Roofing	Sparks Roofi	ng, Inc.												486,900.00	534,780.00			
Electrical	NA		Name															
Geotherm	NA			Genesis Roofing			j	V	/ √	√	√	√	262,500.00	20,900.00	27,900.00			
HVAC	NA						`								21,300.00			\$10.00/lf
Masonry	NA		City	Hend	ersonville, TN													\$6.50/sf
Plumbing	NA		License	Numbe	er	47044								Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			WITHDREW BID
Roofing	Genesis Roo	fing				47641								283,400.00	311,300.00			WITHDREW BID
Electrical	John McBee		Name											•	,			
Geotherm	None Reg	uired		Henl	ley Roofi	ng Con	mpany		1	,	,	,	400 000 00		05 460 00			
HVAC	None Red										V	$\sqrt{}$	420,000.00	40,500.00	35,400.00			\$10.00/lf
Masonry	None Red	······	City	Heisk	ell, TN													\$10.00/sf
Plumbing		*	Lieens	Nima										Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			1 3.00,0.
	None Red Henley Roofi	* ·····	License	Numbe	51	001199	92							460,500.00	· ·			
	JDH Compar		NI											+00,300.00	433,300.00			
			Name	IDI	H Compa	ny Inc												
	None Req			JUF	i compa	iry, ilic.	•					$\sqrt{}$	429,207.00	19,872.00	43,767.00			\$5.00/lf
HVAC	None Req	uired	City	Chatte	anooga, TN													1.7
Masonry	None Red		Oity	Onalli	anouga, m													\$5.00/sf
Plumbing	None Rec		License	Numbe	er	39442								Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			
Roofing	JDH Compar	ny, Inc.												449,079.00	492,846.00			

			Note: No	ne of the	cells are prot	tected; Bid	d Tab v	vorks b	est if yo	use t	ne un-sl	naded spaces, then clear away			he Designers' Manual Char	oter 5 on Procurement	
F54	Bid Tab	Page	2	2	Pursuant to the Invitation to Bid extended for									Signature required only by Presiding Official. Others can be printed or typed.			
					Clyde York 4-H Center Roof Replacements										Others can be printed or typed.		
Bids opened			low many 2 addenda issued:				University of Tennessee, Knoxville / Knox									Presiding Official	David Kaminsky
	Crossville				UT No. 999/001-102-2023												
Target	FF0 000	Contract	t Time	400		bids and modifications must have been received here by										Designer represented by	Brian E. McDonald
	550,000			120	days	11:00 am, local time, June 7, 2024											<u></u>
MACC		Liquidated Damages \$1,000 per day				I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open and read bids and modifications which have been received.										Owner represented by	David Kaminsky
Regula	ated Subcontractors	Bidde	ers (name	, city, lie	cense nun	mber)	Orime Stm	Adden Ack	Bid Secur	Unit Prices	Drug Affid	Base Bid	Alt #1	Alt #2	Alt #3	Alt #4	Other notations
Electrical		Name															
Geotherm			Lynn S	d Const	i.			NO BID									
HVAC											NO DID						
Masonry		City	Knoxville														
Plumbing		License	Number 51764														
Roofing					51/04												
Electrical		Name															
Geotherm			Pinpoi	ofing LL	LC						NO BID						
HVAC			-		-							IAO DID					
Masonry		City	Knoxville														
Plumbing		License	Number														
Roofing					75537												
	Richland Industries	Name															
	None Required		Richla	nd Ind	lustries,	LLC		,		40.5-5-5-5							
111/40					,	, LLC √	V	$\sqrt{}$	√	√	$\sqrt{}$	452,306.00	31,952.00	40,350.00			\$5.58/If
	None Required None Required	City	Pulaski, TN	1													\$2.79/sf
	None Required	Licenso	Number										Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			1.2
	7-H Roofing	FICGUSE	radinger		73702								484,258.00	*			
	None Required	Name											10 1,230.00	32 1,000.00			
	None Required	. 401110	Skilled Services		ices		,	,	,	,	,						
	None Required		Okinica oci vices					٧		V	$\sqrt{}$	440,600.00	67,600.00	52,200.00			\$14.00/lf
		City	Knoxville, 1	ΓΝ													\$3.50/sf
Plumbing	None Required	Licones	Number										Base+Alt.1=	Base+A1,2=			1 2 3 3 7 5 .
	None Required Skilled Services	License	34266										508,200.00	-			
Electrical		Name	<u>_</u>										300,200.00	300,400.00			
Geotherm		ivallie	Turner	Roofi	ina Co							NO DIE					
HVAC					9 50.							NO BID					
Masonry		City	Crossville														
Plumbing			r														
Roofing		License	Number		7788												
Electrical		NI	i i			- 											
		Name															
Geotherm																	
HVAC		City															
Masonry		-															
Plumbing		License	Number														
Roofing																	